Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1207123
Vendor Name: DUPAGE COUNTY

Check Detalils:

Check Number: 0336384
Check Amount: $ 1,926.30
Check Date: 3/4/2025

Invoice Details:

Invoice Number: 12202024
Invoice Date: 12/20/2024
PO Number: NULL
Voucher Number: V0872943

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



@ College of DuPage Accounts Payable Office

Check Request Form

This form may be used to request check payments only for those items for which the issuance
of a purchase order would not be appropriate. Attach supporting documentation (e.g., invoice or
agreement). Please refer to Administrative Procedure 2.21, Vendor Payment.

Date: Vendor ID: Vendor Name:
Payee Address: Payment Due Date:
Invoice Number GL Account number(s) GL Account Name Amount
e.g. 01-80-00757-5401001 e.g. Office Supplies

Total | $

Check the appropriate box below:

[ We, the undersigned, hereby certify that the goods/services, for which payment is herein requested, have been
provided in a satisfactory condition/manner. Consequently, payment is appropriate at this time.

[ We, the undersigned, hereby certify that the goods/services, for which payment is herein requested, have not
yet been provided. The first approver indicated below will notify the Accounts Payable Office in writing when the
goods/services have been delivered in a satisfactory condition/manner.

Description on Check:

Other Instructions:

All requests will require the following approvals:

Requester: Print Name:

Budget Officer: Print Name:

Requests $10,000 and over will require the additional approvals below:

Next Level Supervisor (if applicable): Print Name:

Next Level Supervisor (if applicable): Print Name:

Next Level Supervisor (if applicable): Print Name:

Area Administrator (only required if request is $10,000 and over): Print Name:
Area Cabinet Officer (only required if request is $25,000 and over): Print Name:

Board Approval Date (only required if request is $25,000 and over):

Return approved request and all supporting documentation to Accounts Payable (SRC 2132A), invoicing@cod.edu
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"Zerrudo, Marivic" <zerrudom@cod.edu>

FW: [External] Chrome River Invoice Creation Status

"Zerrudo, Marivic" <zerrudom@cod.edu> Wed, Feb 26, 2025 at 05:49 PM UTC
CC:

BCC:

Marivic Zerrudo
Accounts Payable Specialist

College of DuPage

425 Fawell Blvd | SRC 2132 | Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599

phone 630-942-2601 | zerrudom@cod.edu

From: Servin-Garcia, Daniela <servin-garciad@cod.edu>
Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2025 11:45 AM

To: Zerrudo, Marivic <zerrudom@cod.edu>

Subject: RE: [External] Chrome River Invoice Creation Status



From: Zerrudo, Marivic <zerrudom@cod.edu>

Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2025 11:37 AM

To: Servin-Garcia, Daniela <servin-garciad@cod.edu>
Subject: RE: [External] Chrome River Invoice Creation Status

Hi Daniela,



Check Request Form (cont.)

Processing a Check Request:

To expedite the processing of a check request, or other non-purchase order disbursement, the requesting
department should:

1. Verify that the vendor intake process has been completed by the Procurement Office.
Payment cannot be made to a vendor until this process has been completed.

2. Complete and review this check request form and confirm that all relevant supporting documentation
is attached including fully executed contracts, if applicable.

3. Ensure the payee information is complete and includes the vendor’s Colleague ID number.

4. Ensure that the general ledger account number is included and correct.

5. Maintain a copy of the approved check request form for department records.

6. Submit the completed check request form to the Accounts Payable Office.

The check request form will be returned to the budget officer if the information is incomplete, not in
compliance with College Policy, or if budget is not available.
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| sent you an email on 01/16/25 requesting you reach out to Purchasing regarding an additional remit to address.

Attached is the email | sent. The address on the check request has not been added.

If we process this for payment, the check will go to a different location/address

Thanks

Marivic Zerrudo
Accounts Payable Specialist

College of DuPage

425 Fawell Blvd | SRC 2132 | Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599

phone 630-942-2601 | zerrudom@cod.edu

From: Servin-Garcia, Daniela <servin-garciad@cod.edu>
Sent. Monday, February 24, 2025 4:27 PM

To: Zerrudo, Marivic <zerrudom@cod.edu>

Subject: FW: [External] Chrome River Invoice Creation Status




DuPage County
842 N. County Farm Rd.
Wheaton, IL 60187

Dear DuPage County,

The college will be sending a check for unused scholarship funds for the
following student(s):

Name Social Return Term Amount
Security Code
Number
Freeman, Malika XXX-XX-7428 RSD Fall 2024 | $1,089.53
Khak, Ali XXX-XX-5297 RSD Fall 2024 $73.00
Elafifi, Hiedi XXX-XX-0509 RSD Fall 2016 $541.27
Castillo, Vanessa XXX-XX-1857 RSD Fall 2017 $222.50
Total: | $1,926.30

Please review your funds accordingly upon arrival. Please see return code guide
below for reason funds are being returned. Checks should be sent out within 3-4
weeks of notice. If you require any additional documentation or need to speak
to me, please feel free to contact me.

Thank you.
Daritla Sewin-Garcia

Daniela Servin-Garcia
Scholarship Coordinator
Phone: (630) 942 - 2283

Email: servin-garciad@cod.edu
College of DuPage

() College of DuPage

Return Code

W- Student withdrew

RSD- Remaining Scholarship Dollars
DNE - Did not enroll



From: expense-noreply-c5-prod@cal.chromeriver.com <expense-noreply-c5-prod@cal.chromeriver.com
>



Student Information

Hiedi Elafifi - ID#: 1298625

Check Date Scholarship Name/Donor Check Amount Check #
8/27/2024|DuPage County $1,300.00 1030849
TOTAL: $1,300.00
Funds Disbursed Date Semester Paid Amount Paid
9/20/2016|Fall 2016 $758.73
TOTAL: $758.73
Total of payments received: $1,300.00
Total of funds paid to student: $758.73
Difference owed to scholarship donor: $541.27|







Sent: Monday, January 13, 2025 10:03 AM
To: Servin-Garcia, Daniela <servin-garciad@cod.edu>
Subject: [External] Chrome River Invoice Creation Status

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of COD’s system. Do not click links, open attachments, or respond
with sensitive information unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

CHROME

INVOICE IMAGES RECEIVED

We received an e-mail with invoice images sent on M onday, January 13, 2025 at 4:03:00

PM UTC from servin-gar ciad@cod.edu

We attempted to create invoices from the images. Please review the invoice statuses below:

| nvoices created successfully

We were able to create invoices from the following image files you sent and are currently
extracting data. No further action needs to be taken.

0500-1929-341

Check Request - DuPage County (4 students).pdf



2 attachments
Check Request - DuPage County (4 students).pdf

image001.png









Student Information

Malika Freeman - ID#: 0279716

Check Date Scholarship Name/Donor Check Amount Check #
8/27/2024|DuPage County $3,500.00 1197273
TOTAL: $3,500.00
Funds Disbursed Date Semester Paid Amount Paid
11/4/2024|Fall 2024 $2,410.47
TOTAL: $2,410.47
Total of payments received: $3,500.00
Total of funds paid to student: $2,410.47
Difference owed to scholarship donor: $1,089.53




630-407-6600
Fax: 630407-6601

422 N. County Farm Rd.

Wheaton, IL 60187
630-407-2450
Fax: 630-407-2451

630-407-6500
Fax: 630-407-6501

630-407-6500
Fax: 630-407-6501

630-407-6500
Fax: 630-407-6501

Get Connected. Get Help.™

630-407-6500

COMMUNITY SERVICES Fax: 630-407-6501

csprograms@dupagecounty.gov

www.dupagecounty.gov/community

August 29, 2024

College of DuPage

Attn: Scholarship Coordinator
425 Fawell Blvd

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137

Dear Student Financial Services Office:

We are sending along a scholarship award for Malika Freeman, who was a recipient of
the 2024 Community Services Block Grant Scholarship. The recipient was awarded
$3,500.00 to be used towards her educational expense at College of DuPage.

Enclosed you will find our agency’s intended use affidavit that lists what the recipient
can use the scholarship funds for from our scholarship award. All scholarship amounts
must be spent by December 31, 2024.

If you have any questions regarding the enclosed documents, please call 1-800-942-
9412 and ask to speak with Lisa Hamilton or Jennifer Komis.

Sincerely,

(}'a&ﬂfﬂ)\_@_ Locs "C':}’\VM

Lisa Hamilton Jennifer Komis
Manager, Intake & Referral Coordinator, Intake & Referral
DuPage County Community Services DuPage County Community Services

Cc: Gina R. Strafford-Ahmed, Administrator, Intake & Referral
Applicant File

Jack T. Knuepfer Administration Building, 421 N. County Farm Road, Wheaton, lllinois 60187
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Student Information

Ali Khak - ID#: 1696996

Check Date Scholarship Name/Donor Check Amount Check #
9/6/2024|DuPage County $1,000.00 1197730
TOTAL: $1,000.00
Funds Disbursed Date Semester Paid Amount Paid
9/30/2024|Fall 2024 $927.00
TOTAL: $927.00
Total of payments received: $1,000.00
Total of funds paid to student: $927.00
Difference owed to scholarship donor: $73.00




THE FACE OF THIS DOCUMENT HAS A COLORED BACKGROUND. THE REVERSE SIDE OF THIS DOCUMENT SHOWS A SECURITY FEATURE.

S, DUPAGE COUNTY 1197730
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DUPAGE

(630) 407-6600

422 N. County Farm Rd.
Wheaton, IL 60187
(630) 407-2450

(630) 407-6500

(630) 407-6500

(630) 407-6500

COMMUNITY SERVICES

September 18, 2024

College of DuPage

Attn: Scholarship Coordinator
425 Fawell Blvd

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137

Dear Student Financial Services Office:

We are sending along a scholarship award for Ali Khak, who was a recipient of the
2024 Community Services Block Grant Scholarship. The recipient was awarded
$1,000.00 to be used towards her educational expense at College of DuPage.
Enclosed you will find our agency’s intended use affidavit that lists what the recipient
can use the scholarship funds for from our scholarship award. All scholarship amounts
must be spent by December 31, 2024.

If you have any questions regarding the enclosed documents, please call 1-800-942-
9412 and ask to speak with Lisa Hamilton or Jennifer Komis.

Sincerely,

/ Ol Ko

Lisa Hamitton Jennifer Komis
Manager, Intake & Referral Coordinator, Intake & Referral
DuPage County Community Services DuPage County Community Services

Cc: Gina R. Strafford-Ahmed, Administrator, Intake & Referral
Applicant File

421 N. County Farm Road, Wheaton, lllinois 60187 (630) 407-6500 - www.dupagecounty.gov/community



CSBG SCHOLARSHIP PROGRAM
INTENDED USE OF SCHOLARSHIP AFFIDAVIT

Applicant’s Name: A li Kinz

Social Security Number: XXX-XX- 5227

Student ID#:
LAl Kbaxk

intend 1o use the CSBG Scholarship Grant in the Tollowing way(s):

Pty i’ FaY for C[a55 €5a

Remit Pavment To:

School Name: (2 // i:} ¢ oL Qc:‘,}/%:;j;{

School Mailing Address: 4 25 Fawe i £1v4 LlenEjpon i £o72 %
. = 4

Major: STEM

Seholarship Awird Amount: $1.000

[ understand that to petjure myself' in order to obtain assistance is a fraudulent offense for
which [ can be prosecuted. Failure to submit required documents will result in negative
action. Scholarship funds must be used within 90 — 120 days.

Fide OF 30 zezq
Signature Date

HES St Mopied D 18
Address
slen £/ /an o713+
City/Swte 7~ Zip Code

£000 (ks 0%
1<




Student Information

Vanessa Casfillo - ID#: 1049357

Check Date Scholarship Name/Donor Check Amount Check #
9/8/2017|DuPage County $1,000.00 1052476
TOTAL: $1,000.00
Funds Disbursed Date Semester Paid Amount Paid
9/18/2017|Fall 2017 $777.50
TOTAL: $777.50
Total of payments received: $1,000.00
Total of funds paid to student: $777.50
Difference owed to scholarship donor: $222.50







CSBG SCHOLARSHIP PROGRAM
INTENDED USE OF SCHOLARSHIP AFFIDAVIT

Applicant’s Name: Vanessa Castillo " 4 /' Op0 < 2/’{;) Seod~/p rucssé, )7

Social Security Number: XXX-XX- ﬁ?éq'

L, , intend to use the CSBG Scholarship Grant in the
following way(s):

?Pu?%oo % auvhm 3?76@ O

¢
Major: n : anails
Remit Payment To: py 20
School Name: _CQ\M%&‘_EMQ/V Su b v
(
School Mailing Address:

4z
ATT: \:mmmd @9&1\&

I understand that to perjure myself in order to obtain assistance is a fraudulent offense for
which I can be prosecuted. Failure to submit required documents will result in negative
action. Scholarship funds must be used within 90 — 120 days.

itp EIad0ial

Signature Date

205 Executive Do APT. 205

Address

Corol Sheeaon  TL (2DIF8
Cits Zip Code

e e ., CAtY/State

hum_se/clt ser/csbg/99scholarshipaffidavitletter.doc 7/20/2017 9:47 AM
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